
Appendix 4:  Responses to Tariff Consultation 2021 

 

Respondent Comment Response 

 
Mr Khan: 
 

Hello, this is regarding the 
proposal to increase the 
current hackney tarrif. I 
agree that there should 
be an increase as the 
current hackney tarrif is 
awfully low compared to 
how much work I do. Due 
to the current 
circumstances the 
increase in the hackney 
tarrif will much much 
appreciated.  
Thank you. 
 
 

Response sent thanking 
for comment 

 
QuickTaxi4U 
 

 

I received and looked 
through the tariff and 
comparing with existing 
one i am going to work on 
it also I need consultation 
with other trade members. 
Please hold this tariff and 
give us a time to discuss  
 

No further comments 
have been received 
therefore no further action 
to be taken 

Mr Nagra  
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

I am confirming that I 
welcome the proposed 
plan to increase the 
Hackney Carriage Tariff, 
And happily support it.   
 
Please do not hesitate to 
contact me if you need 
any further explanation or 
information in the above 
reference matter.  
 

Response sent thanking 
for comment 

Mr Kabir 
 
 
 

In brief I suggest the day 
rate needs to be higher, it 
needs to be £2.50 as a 
minimum,  ideally £3. 
 
 

Response to Mr Kabir and 
in report to Licensing 
Committee setting out 
position if the higher rate 
suggested is applied. 
It is for the licensing 
committees consideration 

Mr Hussain 
 

Its great to see that 
Changes are being made 

Response sent thanking 
for comment and that 



 
 
 

to the tariff however, I 
was changes to be made 
to tariff 1. 
 

tariff 1 is included in 
proposal 

Mr Warner 
 
 
 

Thank you for your e-mail 
today. 
 
Considering most 
operators have earned 
diddly squat in 2020, I find 
it unbelievable and totally 
unacceptable! 
 
I have paid you over £700 
in the last two months and 
have earned just £180 in 
the same time. Does 
anyone there in the 
Council actually live in the 
real world!!!! 
 

Response sent thanking 
for comment 

Zenab 
 
 
 
 
 
 

Thank you for your email. 
 
I will pass this information 
on to the Hackney Drivers 
and if they have any 
questions or comments I 
will come back to you 
accordingly. 
 

Response sent thanking 
for comment. No further 
comments received 

 

 


